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After many years of happiness, Moni Badmus's marriage is falling apart. Unwilling to lose her only child, a
self-proclaimed daddy’s girl, to her husband in a custody settlement she goes along with his suggestion of an
unconventional marriage intervention. Will Moni’s fear of losing what she holds dear take her to dark places
she never imagined she would go? Sam Badmus has lost his thirst for the things of God. For a while, his
extramarital activities seemed to be a cure for his unsatisfying home life. But soon his risky behavior exacts a
steep price and Sam has to turn to the God he left behind to save his family and maybe even his life. Debo
Ajala and his wife Adele are living the golden life or so it seems. Debo is a respected church deacon and
Adele, a mother to their four adorable sons. Their lives couldn’t be better, that is until Adele’s feelings for
another member of their church surface. Adele’s confession unleashes a series of events that Debo never
expected. He escapes his troubled life by accepting a pastoral position in a city on the other side of Canada,
but soon his twisted past catches up with him. In this emotionally charged tale of sacrifice, temptation, and
redemption, two couples learn sin has consequences and there is no place they can hide from the presence of
God.
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From reader reviews:

Max Norris:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along? Or just adding material if you want something to
explain what your own problem? How about your spare time? Or are you busy person? If you don't have
spare time to try and do others business, it is gives you the sense of being bored faster. And you have free
time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They must answer that question since
just their can do that will. It said that about book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is right. Because
start from on kindergarten until university need this specific Secret Places to read.

Agnes Figueroa:

The actual book Secret Places has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of
profit. The book was written by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research just before write
this book. This book very easy to read you can find the point easily after looking over this book.

Irene Gonzales:

As a college student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the
library or even make summary for some book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's
internal or real their pastime. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to
generally there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring in
addition to can't see colorful images on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for
you personally. As we know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word
says, many ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Secret Places can make you truly feel more interested
to read.

John Martin:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that
question was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you
know that little person including reading or as reading through become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge,
except your teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book. Numerous
books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them are these claims Secret Places.
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