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Encourage Each Other and Be Ready
 
The Thessalonian church was struggling with an unbalanced approach to the Second Coming. While they
eagerly awaited Christ’s return, many believers were placing more value on their future hope than on
peoples’ current needs. Paul addressed this concern with a message that still resonates today. This study
examines Paul’s second letter to the Thessalonians and shares the need for a church that is focused on both
heaven and earth.
 
The Wiersbe Bible Study Series delivers practical, in-depth guides to selected books of the Bible. Featuring
insights from Dr. Warren W. Wiersbe’s Be Ready commentary, this eight-week study includes engaging
questions and practical applications that will help you connect God’s Word with your life.
--
An internationally renowned Bible teacher, Dr. Warren W. Wiersbe has written more than 160 books,
including the popular “BE” series of Bible commentaries. He and his wife, Betty, live in Lincoln, Nebraska.
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From reader reviews:

Mellisa White:

The reserve with title The Wiersbe Bible Study Series: 1 & 2 Thessalonians: Living in Light of Christ's
Return includes a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of advantage after read this
book. This book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this publication represented the condition
of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. That book
will bring you with new era of the globalization. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you
can read it anywhere you want.

Frankie Graybill:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside together with friends, fun activity using family or
just watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by looking at a
book. Ugh, you think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It okay
you can have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like The Wiersbe Bible Study
Series: 1 & 2 Thessalonians: Living in Light of Christ's Return which is having the e-book version. So , try
out this book? Let's see.

Luis Gray:

Within this era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more special
than other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you have to do is
just spending your time not very much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of the books in
the top checklist in your reading list will be The Wiersbe Bible Study Series: 1 & 2 Thessalonians: Living in
Light of Christ's Return. This book which can be qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in
turning out to be precious person. By looking upward and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Ann Bland:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by world wide web on social media. You can choose
the best book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is referred to as of book
The Wiersbe Bible Study Series: 1 & 2 Thessalonians: Living in Light of Christ's Return. Contain your
knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it may add your knowledge and make you happier to
read. It is most essential that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one place to other place.
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