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Stella “I’ve been in and out of hospitals for the past ten months. I’ve had half my liver removed and even
though this time the doctors are very optimistic that they’ve removed all of the tumours, they can’t be sure.
In another three months they want me here again for a check up. Right now I feel better than I’ve ever felt. I
know the damn thing is gone, at least for the moment. Despite that, I can’t make any plans for the future, not
yet. I need to go somewhere where nobody knows me, where I can relax and maybe even forget about all
this. Where I can meet people who don’t think of me as the girl who lost her father and her brother in a car
accident, and who has cancer. I want to have fun, even if it’s for a couple of months.” When Stella decides to
visit her estranged cousin Lisa in Genoa, she has no idea Italy will give her a new reason to live. Max “Her
gaze locked on a scene so beautiful, the picturesque beach paled in comparison. A lifeguard emerged from
the water, his orange trunks stuck to his legs and water dripping all over him. He shook his head to get rid of
some of the water in his hair and Stella felt as if everything started developing in slow motion – tiny drops of
water slid from his neck down his broad chest and muscular arms, along a weaving tattoo on his right
shoulder, and continued downwards towards his chest and washboard stomach, finally getting lost in the
waistband of his trunks. A part of another tattoo peeked over his trunks on his left hip, the other part hidden
under them. It was a total Baywatch moment.” Their love is epic. But there are too many things keeping
them apart. “How could you keep this from me, Lisa? If you had told me the first day I met him, I would
have avoided him like the plague. Nothing would have happened between us.” “I kept your secrets, too,
Stella.” Are Max and Stella strong enough to fight not only for their love, but for their lives?
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From reader reviews:

Emma Latshaw:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Guide is very important thing for us to
know everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or goal; it means that guide has different type.
Some people feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They can be reading whatever they
have because their hobby will be reading a book. Why not the person who don't like looking at a book?
Sometime, individual feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well, probably
you will require this In a heartbeat.

Yvonne Speight:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading addiction
give you lot of advantages. Advantages you got of course the knowledge the rest of the information inside
the book that will improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education books but if you want truly feel
happy read one using theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the In a heartbeat is kind of
guide which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Marjorie Ishee:

The guide with title In a heartbeat has a lot of information that you can study it. You can get a lot of profit
after read this book. That book exist new information the information that exist in this guide represented the
condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to be aware of how the improvement of the world.
That book will bring you with new era of the syndication. You can read the e-book with your smart phone,
so you can read that anywhere you want.

Kaye Reynolds:

A lot of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt the idea
when they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book In a heartbeat to make your
own reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading proficiency is developing when you similar to
reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the feeling about
book and studying especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it. Beside
that the book In a heartbeat can to be your friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in doing what
must you're doing of this time.
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